
 

The energy transition in oil and gas
December roundup
 

Hello readers,
 
Happy New Year and welcome to our first newsletter of 2025, rounding up the biggest stories from
December.
 
2025 looks set to be an interesting year for the oil and gas industry - on the one hand Trump’s
promise to ‘drill, baby, drill’ and Exxon’s plan to increase production - on the other flatlining demand
and huge spare OPEC capacity. With Wall Street analysts expecting oil prices to be lower this year
than last, it seems unlikely we’ll see a huge surge in new production - beyond what is already
coming. Meanwhile, BP and Shell are retreating from their energy transition plans back to their core
focus on oil and gas - which may please shareholders in the short term, but can’t last forever as the
energy transition continues.
 
Please share this newsletter with your colleagues and contacts who can subscribe here. It’s always
great to hear from you, so do email me any feedback or suggestions.
 
Thanks,
Murray

 

New to the newsletter? Subscribe here!
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Stat of the month:
 

18%
 
ExxonMobil’s planned increase in oil
and gas production by 2030.

 

Oil and gas in the transition
 

At the start of December, countries failed to reach an agreement in negotiations over a plastics
treaty, with a proposed cap on total plastic production turning out to be a crucial sticking point in the
talks. The talks were hugely important to the oil and gas industry, with plastics accounting for 15% of
global oil demand and as an expected area of growth - in comparison to road transport where
demand is set to fall. Given its importance to the industry, it was unsurprising to see Saudi Arabia
leading a coalition of petrostates in opposing a cap on plastics production or much beyond voluntary
measures. 
 
As if to reiterate just how much the world can’t rely on voluntary measures, days after the summit
ended Coca-Cola announced it was abandoning its previous goals to collect and recycle a bottle or
can for each one sold, and instead only aims to “help ensure the collection” of 70-75% of the bottles
and cans it sells. For more details on last year’s plastics talks, and to sign up for updates on the next
round of negotiations taking place this year - see GSCC’s plastics newsletter.
 
The US Department of Energy released its long-awaited report on the impacts of LNG exports,
finding that increased LNG exports could raise domestic gas costs, increase global greenhouse gas
emissions and benefit China. The report found that unconstrained LNG exports could push up
wholesale gas prices by nearly a third by 2050, but that consumer bills would only rise by around
3%. Additional US LNG exports would displace more renewables than coal globally, according to the
study, contradicting industry claims that LNG reduces global emissions by replacing coal. Decisions
about the future permitting of LNG export terminals will be taken by the incoming Trump
administration which won’t be bound by the findings of the report. However, the report is likely to be
used as the basis for legal challenges against the approval of any new LNG terminals. 
 
While the future of US LNG remains uncertain, one of Biden’s major oil and gas policies - tackling
methane leakage - appears to be working. The administration introduced new rules requiring drillers
to find and fix leaks, and introduced new fees for excessive releases of methane. According to a
study by S&P, methane emissions in the Permian basin dropped by 26% in 2023. While that’s
progress, research found that methane emissions from US oil and gas facilities were four times the
levels officially reported to the government, so there's still a long way to go.

 

https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq74tbnehjq4wtecdqpubv2entpjvk5edtjytbeetmq4vvednjpwx1fdxv6awhd64r30bb3dxupwx3jd5jq6bb2c5hppbbgdhgq6x39ccpq8wk5c5u7jbb3c5r76bbmc5p6pwtde9jp2rv85nk6jtbjcdjjutk9dtmq6u1d68r34d1d64rjuctg5w&n=4
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq74tbnehjq4wtecdqpubv2entpjvk5edtjytbeetmq4vvednjpwx1fdxv6awhd64r30bb3dxupwx3jd5jq6bb2c5hppbbgdhgq6x39ccpq8wk5c5u7jbb3c5r76bbmc5p6pwtde9jp2rv85nk6jtbjcdjjutk9dtmq6u1d68r34d1d64rjuctg5w&n=4
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq74ybkehgp8tbecnt6ey9ecdqpubvecnvq6bvkeht6yvk7cnt2utkfe8pprvvecxjq4bbfd5p2ut35dngpwt1dehqjutvjdxvjuube5nu6gt9ddnmp8bbmcnt6ubb6enu7awk5&n=5
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq74ybkehgp8tbecnt6ey9ecdqpubvecnvq6bvkeht6yvk7cnt2utkfe8pprvvecxjq4bbfd5p2ut35dngpwt1dehqjutvjdxvjuube5nu6gt9ddnmp8bbmcnt6ubb6enu7awk5&n=5
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyyk5e9qp6rbjc9qpwbb1dtgprybmd5hq6bkfe9kjyrbjcdm6jxk5ecqpavk5e9kqjbvfetjq4xk9cnvjuvv65nu6gt9dcxp6yrk1dgpq0tbme9qp6u35dnmp6rbc5nmpwt3nedu74y8&n=6
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6wybmd5ppawtecdqpubtj60t38bth64qk6c1fcdp6jvb1ehjjywv1enj6jbb1e9gp4ub15nkprvv2c5p2uw3cc5tq8ub35nu74tb1ehwjwu3mdnp0&n=7
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6wybmd5ppawtecdqpubtj60t38bth64qk6c1fcdp6jvb1ehjjywv1enj6jbb1e9gp4ub15nkprvv2c5p2uw3cc5tq8ub35nu74tb1ehwjwu3mdnp0&n=7
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6cx1ecdqpubv3dxq78tbeegqkedb46nk64dk45mt64rtr5mu3cchh5ngkjd9n5mwp6dtg70wked9m65hp8&n=8
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6cx1ecdqpubv3dxq78tbeegqkedb46nk64dk45mt64rtr5mu3cchh5ngkjd9n5mwp6dtg70wked9m65hp8&n=8
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxbk68rjwrv1dnr62ub7drpp2wk3d1mqct9ecdqpubv8dxppabtzemyked1q6dh68ctq6hj34chq61k3ec1ncrw3gtb66mr2cub47mr6acv5cmtp4c9t64&n=9
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjytkfedtpjv1ecnq6awk7f4q6evvp5xgq0w1fchqp6uv5ehmpwt35f0qp8vv3ddjq8bv9dtj6ay1f6cr0&n=10
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq78u35cxup2wk4d5gpwbk3dxpjyxbk5nq6axvk5wt30chm5xj6artf64vjyrk9chjpwbbec5u7awk1dgpperbk5njqgw3fe9u0&n=11
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq78u35cxup2wk4d5gpwbk3dxpjyxbk5nq6axvk5wt30chm5xj6artf64vjyrk9chjpwbbec5u7awk1dgpperbk5njqgw3fe9u0&n=11
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6cx1ecdqpubv3dxq78tbeegqk0thr6xjkgdv45mw3ad9m5mu30e1m5nh6achr5nk38c1r65j64d9hcmv3c&n=12
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6cx1ecdqpubv3dxq78tbeegqk0thr6xjkgdv45mw3ad9m5mu30e1m5nh6achr5nk38c1r65j64d9hcmv3c8tufrx78tbregym4xbm4mt30x38cmjk4c3kehup8y9568r6cvvndtj2achgehm62x1568r62t34d5u6jvvec5p2achgan9jachg9h74e99j61jqgw3fe9u7699j61vpyxbccgjk4c34d5tq0v31cdjjachgdnqq4t9568r74tbecnvp2rkccntjachgehm62vh568r66vv1dgjk4c37dhqp4rbcdhwg&n=13
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyubectp7atbecdjpurbg5tqq4ttfc9t6jtb6d5q6ebunacpmrkj75n0p8wtd89t6jtb6d5q6eb9j70uked1379z3mx35f1u3urvcc5mpuubecwjk4c3md1gq899j61mq899j61j6jwvgdhgp6tbk4mt30rvfc5p2achgc5q6899j61t6at3ncdjq699j61kprvv2c5p2achgcnppjwvkd5qpwwr&n=14
https://ecf3.apms5.com/anywhere/m?s=ecf3&m=s_9a002d5f-d321-4f23-8856-bc6f47b481df&u=e1jq4wvfdtfk8h9p74w4ad265mrm4dhn5mu30h225mwk2e265n2k0d1r6t1m8hj588t4a&r2=d1u78w3k78qjyxvqewq6cx1ecdqpubv3dxq78tbeegqp4c1t6xj3gt315mw38dk55mu6achk5ngk6r9p5mw3jt1hc4v66rv369k68fvkcnkputbeeh4p8f9t70ukgctg6cujurb36cujur9gc9gjutb46gu2uctq71jkacv671hp2tb3&n=15


 

Energy transition strategies
 

The Financial Times has a persuasive analysis of the challenge facing BP and Shell - that they are
facing a “valley of death” between shareholders that want the companies to be focused on oil and
gas, and those that want to invest in a clean energy company. The theory goes that some investors
want to put their money into oil and gas, and don’t want more money going into renewables that
deliver lower returns. For those shareholders, accelerating the companies’ energy transition makes
them less attractive and drives down their share prices. But for other investors who are looking to
invest in clean energy, BP and Shell are still too focused on oil and gas to make it into their
portfolios. So the companies face a gap between the two groups that’s tough to cross - though
TotalEnergies seems to be managing it. In the face of this challenge, BP and Shell are retreating to
the former set of investors and doubling down on oil and gas.

Exxon increased its planned capital expenditure and is aiming to increase oil and gas production by
nearly a fifth by the end of the decade. The aim to increase production is in stark contrast to other
firms in the sector that are reducing their planned investments, such as Chevron. Notably, for a
company known for its focus on oil and gas and scepticism about the energy transition, Exxon plans
to spend up to USD 30 billion on ‘low carbon’ technologies between 2025 and 2030, largely on CCS,
hydrogen and lithium mining.

Exxon’s decision to increase production is all the more remarkable given the state of oil and gas
markets, with even the traditionally bullish OPEC once again cutting its forecasts for future oil
demand. The group has had to cut its forecasts for 2024 oil demand consecutively five times in the
face of weak demand, particularly from China. OPEC has also delayed releasing over 2 million
barrels a day of spare production capacity to the market, given ongoing low demand and low prices.

 

Clean energy investments
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BP announced that it will merge its offshore wind business with JERA, Japan’s largest power
generation company, to produce a new joint venture that would be the world’s fourth largest player in
the industry. The move has been seen as a major retreat by BP, cutting its planned capital
expenditure on offshore wind by as much as USD 5 billion and potentially packaging up its wind
business for a future sale. Shell has gone even further, stating that it will not undertake any new
offshore wind projects, with Shell’s CEO Wael Sawan saying that “we do not see ourselves as being
advantaged in renewable generation”. TotalEnergies has continued to buck this trend, and is instead
increasing its renewables investments - this time by buying German renewable developer VSB
Group for EUR 1.57 billion.

In 2022, Shell started shipping ‘carbon neutral LNG’, with huge purchases of carbon offsets claimed
to eliminate the emissions from the LNG. However a new investigation revealed that some of the
offsets Shell purchased as part of the scheme have since failed verification, and the emissions
reduction projects may have never happened at all.

 

 

Hydrogen & ammonia
 

Green hydrogen - made from renewable energy - is now forecast to be far more expensive than
previously expected. BloombergNEF has more than tripled its forecast for green hydrogen costs in
2050, to levels above the USD 1 / kg that US President Joe Biden aimed to achieve by 2030. The
higher price forecasts now means that green hydrogen would only be cost competitive with grey
hydrogen - made from natural gas with carbon emissions released into the atmosphere - in China
and India, and not until 2040. With the underlying economics no longer in its favour, green hydrogen
will need even more government support to be able to replace grey hydrogen - never mind take on
new roles in the clean energy economy.
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Carbon capture and storage (CCS)
 

Japan has long sought to use CCS to reduce its emissions but has faced the challenge of lacking
suitable sites to store carbon, such as old oil and gas fields. The government is now proposing an
innovative solution - to drill purpose built underground storage facilities for domestically captured
carbon. The scale of the ambition is enormous - with Japan aiming to store 20% of the country’s
emissions by 2050. The economics of CCS have always been challenging, so adding in the costs of
drilling storage sites could prove to be prohibitive.
 
The UK government could face paying compensation of up to GBP 6 billion to the developers of a
new gas-CCS power station, if the project is blocked by legal challenges. The secret agreement,
which appears to have been central to the financial go-ahead for the UK’s first CCS power station,
was seen by the Financial Times. The project is facing a legal challenge over its carbon emissions
and the government’s decision-making process in assessing its contribution to decarbonisation.

Recent academic research shows the scale of the challenge in ensuring that the storage part of CCS
is effective in keeping the global climate stable. The study found that carbon dioxide needs to be
effectively stored for at least 1,000 years in order to be effective in neutralising fossil fuel emissions.
Given the risks of leakage or failure, the results raise the question of who will be monitoring and
repairing these undersea storage facilities for the next millennium.

 

 

New to the newsletter? Subscribe here!

 

In order to help gauge how oil and gas companies are positioning themselves in the energy transition, this newsletter
specifically focuses on how they are moving into renewables and clean energy. To offer up-to-date analysis, it uses
insight from media sources and subscription-based databases, like BloombergNEF. 
 
Feel free to forward this newsletter on to colleagues!
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